
Tricia Hudson's ascent from an administrative assistant to an esteemed Regional Vice 
President of Howard Hanna Real Estate Services is a narrative of passion, perseverance, 
and prowess. Adding to her impressive credentials, Tricia serves as a dedicated Director for 
the Southern Ohio Association of REALTORS®, exemplifying what it truly means to lead 
with heart and expertise in the real estate world. 

Embarking on her real estate journey as an administrative assistant, Tricia delved deep into 
the operational intricacies of the industry. This foundational role equipped her with 
unparalleled insights, a keen understanding of market dynamics, and a customer-centric 
approach that would become the hallmark of her professional journey. In her role at Howard 
Hanna, Tricia oversees multiple offices, ensuring that agents are equipped with the best 
tools, training, and resources. 

As a Director for the Southern Ohio Association of REALTORS®, Tricia champions the 
interests of real estate professionals, advocating for ethical practices, continuous education, 
and community involvement. She plays a pivotal role in shaping policies, offering guidance, 
and providing resources to REALTORS® to help them navigate the ever-evolving real 
estate landscape.   

Her leadership style is characterized by her approachability and her genuine desire to see 
every member of her team succeed. She often reminisces about her early days as an 
administrative assistant, using her story to motivate and inspire, reminding her teams of the 
endless possibilities that come with dedication and a learner's mindset. 

Away from the hustle of the property market, Tricia is an avid baseball enthusiast—a 
passion she shares with her family. Her pride shines brightest when she talks about her 
son, a professional baseball player, whose journey she has supported from Knothole to the 
Present. Much like in her professional world, Tricia's dedication to the sport reflects her 
belief in hard work, teamwork, and the joy of pursuing one's passion. 

Outside of her many commitments, Tricia often finds herself in baseball stadiums, cheering 
on her son and immersing herself in the game she loves. Her story serves as an inspiration 
not only to her colleagues but also to aspiring athletes in her family, showcasing that with 
dedication and belief, any pitch life throws can be turned into a home run. 

To connect with Tricia or to learn more about opportunities at Howard Hanna Real Estate 
Services, she welcomes you to reach out via triciahudson@howardhanna.com or through 
the company's official website www.howardhanna.com. 


